






















































AMENDMENTS TO THE BYLAWS OF 
PINEHURST - HIGHFIELD HOMEOWNERS 

ASSOCIATION 
WHEREAS, the Pinehurst - Highfield Homeowners Association (the "Association") is a Washington 
nonprofit corporation organized under RCW Chapter 24.03; and 

WHEREAS, the Association's current Bylaws were amended and restated in 2022; and 

WHEREAS, at the Annual Meeting of the Association held on January 28, 2025, the Members voted to 
approve certain amendments to the Bylaws as set forth herein; and 

WHEREAS, the required notice was provided to all Members in accordance with the Bylaws and 
applicable law; 

NOW, THEREFORE, the Bylaws of the Association are hereby amended as follows: 

ARTICLE I - AMENDMENTS 

Section 1. Amendment to Section 4.5.3 (Rights and Privileges of Membership) 

Section 4.5.3 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

"4.5.3 Rights and Privileges of Membership. Members in Good Standing shall have the right to run for 
and hold positions as Directors or Officers of the Association and vote on matters affecting the 
Association. Members in Good Standing, their immediate family members, well-behaved guests and 
lawful tenants of Owners shall also have the privilege of using any special services and/or facilities 
provided by the Association for use by its Members, above and beyond basic rights of ingress, egress and 
support which are not dependent upon Good Standing status. Such rights and privileges are subject to 
payment of all dues, charges or assessments as may be lawfully imposed by the Board of Directors from 
time to time, and are further subject to remaining in compliance with all other provisions of the 
Governing Documents. A Member who fails to pay all required dues, charges or assessments, or who is 
found to have violated other provisions of the Governing Documents in a proceeding conducted under 
Section 7.10 hereof, shall cease to be a Member in Good Standing and may lose any or all of the 
foregoing rights and privileges of membership until such time as the Member shall make all required 
payments and/or satisfy any conditions required of the Member in such proceeding." 

Section 2. Amendment to Section 4.8.1 (Voting Rights) 

Section 4.8.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 



"4.8.1 Voting Rights. Each owner in good standing has the right to vote at Meetings of the Association 
for the election of Directors and with respect to such other matters that are not within the powers of the 
Board of Directors as may lawfully come before the Meeting. Each Owner shall be entitled to one vote for 
each Lot owned by such Owner on each matter submitted to a vote of the Owners. In the event that a Lot 
is owned by the Association, the votes allocated to such Lot must be cast in the same proportions as the 
votes cast on the matter by Lot Owners other than the Association. Cumulative voting shall not be 
permitted." 

Section 3. Amendment to Section 4.8.6 (Order of Business) 

Section 4.8.6 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

"4.8.6 Order of Business. The agenda of the Annual Meeting shall include: the approval of the minutes 
of the previous annual meeting and any special meetings of the Association, the election of Directors (in 
accord with section 5.3), the ratification of the annual budget, and any other business placed on the 
agenda. In the absence of a quorum, only the ratification of the budget can be considered. Only matters 
described in the Notice of a Special Meeting may be considered at such a Meeting, and the order of 
business at a Special Meeting shall generally conform to the order specified in the Notice of such 
Meeting." 

Section 4. Amendment to Section 5.1.1 (Number of Directors) 

Section 5.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

"5.1.1 Number of Directors. The number of Directors on the Board shall be five (5), but such number 
may thereafter be increased or decreased as provided in these Bylaws, provided that the Board shall never 
consist of fewer than three (3) members. New board members elected at the annual meeting of the 
association shall take office upon the adjournment of the annual organizational meeting. Promptly 
following such election, the Board shall elect or appoint the Officers of the Association described in 
Article 6 hereof." 

Section 5. Amendment to Section 5.1.2 (Qualifications) 

Section 5.1.2 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

"5.1.2 Qualifications. All members of the Board of Directors must be Owners who remain Members in 
Good Standing. The term "Owner" in such context shall be deemed to include any director, officer, 
partner in, or trustee of any entity which is, either alone or in conjunction with another person or entity, an 
Owner. Any Officer or Director of the Association who would not be eligible to serve as such if (s)he 
were not a director, officer, partner in, or trustee of such an entity shall be disqualified from continuing in 
office if (s)he ceases to have any such affiliation with that entity." 

Section 6. Amendment to Section 5.3 (Removal of Directors) 

Section 5.3 is hereby amended by adding the following sentence at the end: 



"Once removed by majority vote, that member is ineligible to serve on the Board of Directors in 
perpetuity." 

Section 7. Amendment to Section 5.12 (Committees of the Board) 

Section 5.12 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

"5.12 Committees of the Board. The Board of Directors may, at any time, establish one or more 
committees to advise the Board on a particular matter of interest. The Board shall provide a written 
charge to each committee established. The committee will present a report to the Board and be discharged 
when that purpose has been fulfilled. The members of any such Committee must include one or more 
Board members, and may include Owners, or other persons whose participation is deemed useful by the 
Board. Any committee established shall be advisory to the Board. No powers of Association (under 
section 4.4) may be delegated to a committee." 

Section 8. Amendment to Section 6.1 (Principal Officers) 

The third sentence of Section 6.1 is hereby amended to read as follows: 

"Two or more offices may be held by the same person, except the offices of President and 
Treasurer." 

ARTICLE II - CORRECTIONS 

Section 1. Correction to Section 5.2.5 (Quorum: Participation and Voting) 

The reference in the last sentence of Section 5.2.5 to "Section 5.3.7" is hereby corrected to read "Section 
5.2.7." 

Section 2. Correction to Section 6.7 (Treasurer) 

The last sentence of Section 6.7 is hereby corrected to read as follows: 

"An Assistant Treasurer may perform the duties and exercise the powers of the Treasurer in the 
absence or disability of the Treasurer and shall perform such other duties as the Board of Directors 
may prescribe." 

ARTICLE III - GENERAL PROVISIONS 

Section 1. Effective Date 

These amendments shall be effective immediately upon adoption. 



Section 2. Remaining Provisions 

Except as specifically amended herein, all other provisions of the Bylaws shall remain in full force and 
effect. 

Section 3. Conflicts 

In the event of any conflict between these amendments and the existing Bylaws, these amendments shall 
control. 
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